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Concerned Port Citizens Meet 
On Youth Center Issue b y B r l i n B a c k l r 

community forum 
M r. G U I P o t l a r I I T M l U t M t i c l o n 
i u i r a n i l* a a i l n q u a n c y In tart. 

A community forum on the 
issue ctf the establishment of a 
youth center in Port Washington 
was held at the United Methodist 
Church on December 2 at 8:00 
pm Rev, Randall C. Paige, the 
associate pastor of the Methodist 
Church, arranged the meeting, 
inviting community leaders and 
representatives from the schools, 
churches, synagogues, athletic 
and commun i t y services 
organizations. Those attending 
the meeting discussed whether a 

youth center would service 
various other groups such as 
senior citizens and pre-teenage 
youths They also considered 
whether the center should be in 
one cent ra l locat ion or a 
combination erf locations, and if i t 
would decrease the incidence of 
juvenile delinquency in Port 
Wash ing t on . They f u r t h e r 
discussed what types of activities 
a youth center should provide. 
Despite the recommendations 
against the establishment of a 
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HRC Prepares Festive Celebration 81 
b y G a r y S c l i a n i t r 

On Wednesday, December 23. 
Schreiber wi l l hold its annual 
holiday commemoration. Cele-
bration '81 E^arly Wednesday 
morning, the festivities wi l l begin 
w i t h c o n c e r t s f e a t u r i n g 
Schreiber's Band, Choir, and 
Orchestra At 10:35, aided by the 
Cookie Monster, the traditional 
cookies and cider wi l l be served 
to the entire student body. The 
Human Relations Committee, 
which wi l l sponsor the event, 
hopes to have a record 10,000 
cookies this year The cookies 
wi l l again be made by the student 
body. Because the previous donor 
(rf the cider graduated from 

English Teachers 
Recehre Prizes 

Marjorie El-Kadi and Mar t in 
Hamburger, both of Schreiber's 
Eng l i sh Departmen, were 
announced as winners In a 
writ ing contest sponsored by the 
l.on(( I s l and Teacher News 
Magaiine. Mrs. El-Kadi received 
the twenty-five dollar first place 
award in the short story c a t ^o r y 
for her piece ent i t led 
"Language ' Mr. Hamburger 
was the recipient of a second 
place prize in the poetry category 
for his "Planting Instructions." 

Schreiber last June, the HRC is 
hoping for financial assistance 
from the Student Government. 

The theme of this years cele-
bration wi l l be. 'A Charlie Brown 
Christmas. "Thecafeteria wi l l be 
decorated acco rd ing l y w i t h 
"Peanuts" characters. Alison 
Kaplan, the head of the Decora-
tions Committee, is working with 
art teacher Mr Hurley, in order 
to f i l l the otherwise dreary cafe-
teria walls with beautiful, color-
ful decorations 

The purpose of Celebration '81 
w i l l be to bring the school 
together, and to produce a more 
u n i t e d f e e l i n g t h r o u g h o u t 

Schreiber. 
As usual, there wi l l be a guest 

Santa Claus collecting money 
from ttie students In the past, 
money was collected for the 
Orphanage Fund, but this year 
the HRC is helping the G.O, raise 
money for the Luke McGregor 
Fund. 

During the week of November 
30th. a greeting card contest wi l l 
be he ld . Eve ryone i n the 
Schreiber community w i l l re-
ceive a card, hand signed by the 
HRC. Mrs Hines. advisor of the 
committee said. " I hope that 
everyone wi l l , enjoy, celebrate 
and I hope for safety." 

G.O. Holds Benefit Dance 

Inside 
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b y S i a p n a n B r i n N t n i n 

The Deep River Dance for the 
benefit of Luke McGregor , 
Operation Spinal Cord, SeniOT 
citizens Christmas party, and the 
Chess Club, were the main topics 
discussed at the G.O. meeting on 
Thursday, December 3. 

The council voted unanimously 
to raise the price to S5 per person 
for the Luke McGregor benefit 
dance which wi l l be held on Dec. 
18. The profits wi l l go to Luke's 
family to help defray hospital ex-
penses after his recent spinal in-
jury . 

Jon Goldstein made a moving 
speech concerning the National 
Spinal Cord Injury Foundation. 
He said the 250,000 people who 
are afflicted with these types of 
injuries, "'are really people ' He 
mentioned that Luke McGregor 
had the support of the whole 
school behind h im, but most of 
these people have no one behind 
ihem. TTiis organization provides 
housing, transportat ion, jobs, 
and leisure activities for these 
people. The response was over-
whelming when Jon asked if any 
sbjdents would be wi l l ing to help 

youth or community center by 
Gus Potter , the Youth 
Coordinator for Nassau County, 
the participation at the forum 
agreed that they should take an 
inventory of ai l community 
services presently available, and 
that a survey should be taken to 
determine the needs of a l l 
students in the junior and seniw 
high schools. 

School board member James 
Cowles said. "The town needs a 
community center program. " not 
just a p r t ^ r am serving Port's 
youths. He was in favor of a 
center w i t h a permanent 
location. Superintendent of 
S«.'hools Huge McGuigan said. 
"The idea of having one i a youth 
or community centerl at a 
central place is archaic. ' He was 
in favor of diversified community 
programs in various parts of 
town sponsored by one 
organizational structure. 

Mina Weiner. the president of 
the school board, wanted to make 

sure thai any program developed 
would not duplicate any service 
alreflfly offered in the communi-
ty. She and other community 
representatives urged that the 
survey of community services be 
taken. Vincent Meier, the 
coord inator of Port Youth 
Athletics agreed, to form a com-
mittee to compile the needed 
information Mrs. Weiner was 
also in favor of the survey of the 
student population to determine 
their needs. G O President 
Anthony Scaramucci who 
attended the meeting with his 
officers John Stark and Steve 
Butcher volunteered the services 
of the student government in ad-
ministering the survey in the 
homerooms erf Schreiber and the 
Junior high schools 

While most of those present at 
the meeting were leaning' 
toward the idea of a center serv-
ing the entire community, Mr. 

(Continued on page 5) 

DAR Awards Scaramucci 
Anthony Scaramucci is this 

year's recipient of the Daughters 
of the American Revolution Good 
Citizenship Award. The award, 
which recognizes leadership and 
service to the school community 
along w i t h the qual i t ies of 
dependalMlitv aod patriotism. 

was presented to Anthony by the 
North Reding Chapter of the DAR 
at the North Hempstead Country 
Club on December 9 The award 
makes Anthony eligible for state 
and national competitions for the 
Good Citizenship Award. 

raise money for the Nassau chap-
ter of this organization. 

Anthony Sca ramucc i also 
spoke on behalf of Jeanette Smith 
who is the head of the Community 
Service Oi^anization.. She has 
CH-ganized Christmas parties for 
the local senior citizens, on Dec 
17 at Manorhaven and at Flower 
Hi l l on Dec. 18 from 1:00 to 2:30. 
Volunteers are needed. 

Ethan Halm asked the council 
for S20 for the Chess Club so that 
they may join the Nassau County 
Inlerscholastic Chess League. 
Ethan tried to gain sympathy 
with his. "chess fags are people 
too.'" After a debate, a vote was 
taken, and the club was awarded 
the mcwiey. 

There was also talk of a Fami ly 
Feud type of show with a Gong 
Show intermission. Anthwiy said 
that the picnic tables and trees 
would arrive in the s[»ing Janet 
Byron was awarded 1125 for a full 
page G.O advertisement in the 
yearbook. The meeting closed 
with a discussion concerning the 
proposed Youth Center, but no 
conclusions were made. 

M B U my O r l y N u d a t 
C « a r C a r r a l n a a * M i i t t l«T P»rt In tht C « u n ( v c n t m p i o n t n i p . 
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HRC Sends Delegates 
To National Convention 

Stage Band Plays To Assembly 

Ay liana RoMniwels 

The Human Relations 
Commiltee sent K i l l Wunder and 
Itene Rosenzweig as delegates to 
the Nat ional Conference of 
Christians and Jews on December 
6 The Ihree day seminar 
included leadership and human 
relationship workshops at the 

r Holiday Hills Hotel in Pauling. 
New York, 

The other delegates offered a 
cross section of ethnic and 

: religious backgrounds, including 
black Protestants from the South 
Bronx, white Catholics from 
Bayonne. New Jersey. Puerto 
Ricans from Spanish Harlem. 
Jews. India>iS, and many others. 

Schrelber Names 
Japan Exchange 

Nominee 
by Osnaia Park 

Joy Hampton was selected to 
represent Schreiber in 
competition for a full Japanese 
Government scholarship in 
Youth for Understandings eight 
week summer program to Japan 
Only juniors were allowed to 
participate. Mr. Bartels has sent 
out the nominee's name, and the 
Statewide Commit tee of 
Educators w i l l rev iew her 
record. Joy has already met the 
minimum requirements. These 
requirements are that she must 
have a 3.5 grade point average 
and one or more years study in 
any foreign language, show 
evidence of leadership and 
maturity, and be able lo adapt to 
unfamiliar environments. The 
Statewide Commit tee of 
E^ducators wil l only select two 
candidles from New York State 

I f Joy is selected, she wi l l go to 
Washington. D C next June lo 
meet Senator Alfonse D'Amato. 
Senator Danie l Pat r i ck 
Moynihan, and the Ambassador 
of Japan, who will give an 
orientation meeting on Japanese 
culture Joy wil l then live with a 
"volunteer • Japanese family 
during the summer 

HtLP WANTED 
Help Wanted • high school senior 
wanted for Saturdays lo assist in 
dental office Good personality. 
Wil l t ra in! Call Dr. Fr iedman 
nvdni -Mlays at &83 'U661 

> Aquirium Sat-Upi and 
Raniali wilh monthly 
mainlananae and guarantfa. 
55 Galloni to 135 Gallom 

k Special Aquarjum Tanks 
Set Upi 

t Wa alto hava a full supply of 
Garb I It, Hamttari. Gumea 
Put, Tuit iK, and SnakasI 

Racialproblemsatschool. lack 
of communica t i on between 
students and leachers, cliques,-
student apathy, and poor 
guidance were al l topics for the 
problem solving clinic. 

By far the most interesting and 
entertaining exercise of the 
conference was role playing In 
skits students acled out difficult 
situations that were common to 
them They were al l very real 
and some of them were very 
funny. This exercise 
accomplished what seemed to be 
one of the major goals of the 
conference This was to see how 
you appear to others by playing 
the role of another. 

Captioning 
Helps Deaf 

by John Z»> 

The Nat ional Capt ion ing 
Institute. i N C I i . is a program 
that helps the deaf people of the 
United States through closed 
capt ioned te lev is ion. Closed 
captioning is a process by which 
the audio portion of a television 
program is t rans la ted in to 
subtitles. 

So far ABC. NBC and PBS are 
pa r t i c i pa t ing in closed 
captioning The CBS network is 
not participating because they 
tnink that they can design their 
o w T i captioning system called 
•Telexl" However, NCI thinks 

that i t w i l l not be ready for ten 
years. 

ABC now has closed captioned 
nalional news which is broadcast 
al 7 p.m To receive closed 
captioned broadcasts, you must 
have an adapter or a television 
with the adapter bui l l in. 

As a deaf person, I really enjoy 
closed captioned te levis ion 
because it helps me to understand 
what the people on the screenare 
talkmg about ABC. NBC, and 
PBS combined have aboul thirty 
hours of closed capt ioned 
programming each week. 

The special equipment can be 
purchased al Sears The adapter 
costs aboul $260 00 and the 
television w i l h the b u i l l - i n 
adapter costs aboul tS30 00 

iropkral isle aquarium 
704 Pi . WMhington Blvd. 

Pt. WathiriTton 

883-2072 

The Stage Band led by Senior 
Greg Thymius. played lo anenUi-
usiastic assembly of the student 
body on November 2:i in Ihe 
gymnasium The band's f irst 
performance was well-received 
and re f lec led in its ear ly 
scheduling the talent of the 
group. 

The band, having rehearsed 
this year with Mr. Capobiancoas 
well as Mr. Fish, gotoff t oagrea l 
starl wi lh its first appearance. 
The band's talent lies in Ihe 
collaboration of seasoned senior 

by Matt Hiikan 

members like All-State Ray 
Sapirstein and Ken Sawka with 
talented junior and sophomore 
players. 

The program included Tribute 
lo Brown fealuring Ken Sawka on 
lenor and Ray Sapirslein on 
trumpet. Blues (or Sleffan with 
Ray Sapirstein on trumpet, and 
Corey Berman and Dan Slater on 
alto sax. Basic Straight Ahead 
featuring Greg Thymius on tenor 
and Fat Farre l on piano, and 
Mercy. Mercy. Mercy. 

A Summer Experience 
If Bi l ly could, he would stand 

three feel high. His blond hair 
and pale blue eyes make him a 
good prospect for a gambol dale, 
bul first he must overcome his 
hypoionio (an underdevelopment 
of muscle tissue!. Bi l ly is five 
years old A life expectancy often 
years is conceivable for him 
should he receive Ihe proper 
attention. Many high school stu-
dents have provided this atten-
tion by working as counselors in 
camps sponsored by the Associa-
lion for theHelpof Retarded Chil-
dren Schreiber students are well 
known for Iheir volunteer work in 
the communily Students can be 
found aiding the deaf and blind at 
Ihe Helen Keller Center as well as 
candy-striping and working in the 
laboratories of the local medical 
centers. This past summer I 
volunteered a l an A H R C . camp 
from 9:00 a.m. to3:00 p.m. every 
day. 

The A H R.C was founded 
many years ago for Ihe purpose 
of educating retarded and dis-
abled children, like Bi l ly, prepar-
ing Ihem for a somewhat in-
dependent adult life. 

Bil ly is one of a group of four-
teen campers that I worked wi lh 
this summer, along with Ihree 
other counselors and one teacher. 
The kids ranged in age from four 
years to eight years. 

The camp day begins when Ihe 
campers are unUiaded from Ihe 
buses and deposited at Ihe ap-
propriate classrooms. The camp 
day includes many aclivil ies 

by Julie Moll 

geared toward certain traits thai 
the campers need lo develop For 
example, the ability to recognize 
famil iar objec'ls is encouraged 
during the morning lesson. Each 
day a l this l ime we would review 
the names of colors and animals. 
By the end of Ihe summer several 
of Ihe campers could recognize 
the famil iar pictures, and a few 
could sign-spell Ihe names. Then 
we would lake Ihe campers lo Ihe 
morning activity • art, music, or 
physical development. Next we 
would have lunch, after which we 
would walk the kids up lo Ihe pool 
for closely supervised swimming 
This l ime al Ihe pool is important 
for children like Bil ly who need to 
develop their muscles I I is also 
important to introduce unusual 
stimulus to Ihe over-protected 
children. Back al the classroom, 
the kids are changed for rest 
hour, afler which is snack l ime It 
is thenabout 2:30,and wepack up 
the campers and load them on 
their buses. I I is a quick and 
satisfying day 

Working at A.H.R C was an in-
credible experience. I learned 
more about special education, 
and special children, then I would 
nlherwise have had Ihe oppor-
lunily to. I t is difficult to express 
the qualities of this kind of work 
The A.H.R.C. pro\ides an in-
valuable service lo these kids, 
and working there can be a 
meaningful experience for any-
one 

- - - - - -^f 

48 Main Street 
Port Washington, N.V. 

g -eMon. -SaL 
767-1530 

NHS Holds 
Adeiphi Trip 

by Paiar Nliicn 
Twenty Schreiber NHS stu-

dents attended eleven university-
style lectures on an array of 
topics ranging from biology to 
politics on Tuesday. November 
17. al Adeiphi University. The 
day-long presentation, although, 
obviously, a selling jol i for Adei-
phi, said Dr. Rothman. the ad-
visor o( the NHS, offered an ex-
cellent variety of education and a 
good opportunity for the students 
lo atjsorb "the exciting new re-
search currently underway in 
the fields discussed. " There was 
so much variety in such a short 
t ime " said Dr. Rothman, 'that 
there was no opportunity for 
complete expositions, i could 
have spent Ihe whole day Ihere ' 

Band Raises Funds 
by Anne An^eJonp 

The tjand and Portetles have 
been raising funds for their up-
coming tr ip lo Florida. They have 
formed a Booster Club and are 
selling chances al one dollar a 
piece. There wi l l be drawings 
each month from now until May, 
In the first draw ing. Sue Raimon-
do was elected president and 
awarded $100 oo Ellen Wefer was 
elected vice-president and 
awarded twenty-five dollars The 
Ab i lo l s . of Port Washington, 
were elected secre tary and 
awarded ten dollars, and Ed 
Dawson was elected treasurer 
and also awarded len dollars. The 
next drawing wil l be on Januarv 
4. 

2071) Norlhrrn Blvd. 
Manha.-iM-l. N. 1 . 
M\ 7 - 7 8 2 6 

Free Aherations for 
the life of the Garment 

DRIVER EDUCATION 
Vincent Smith High School 

322 Port Washington Boulevard 
Port Washington, N.Y. 11050 

Tel. No. (516) PO 7 - 6 8 0 0 (9 a.m. • 4 p.m.) 
(516) 6 8 1 - 3 9 5 8 (8 p.m. - 10 p.m.) 

We w i l l Offer You The 
Best Program Available 

Applications 
Available By Mail 

L imi ted Enrol lment 
H I G H L I G H T S ! ! ! 

Schreiber H.S. Students-We are the closest school 

Convenient Location 
Saturdays, Weekdsys Schedules 
New 1982 Air Cof«J. Cars 
Experienced Teachers 
Ful ly Certif ied Recognized Coruse 
Personalized Instruction 
Card Available for Road Test for Nominal Fee 

Register Now! person or by mad 

Spring • Summef » FaH 

• Spsciol but inatunon' i Iwnch menu 
• Di«t m«nw for lh« calorie cenicieui 
• Take out and catering tervice with a gourmet touch 

1042 NORTHERN BLVD., ROSLYN ESTATES, N.Y. 
fEect of Seorffigtown M.i 

(516) 621 -187 0 
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by M l r l o r l * E l - K l d l 
Mrs, Sklar sal awkwardly in a 

student's chair. Her smock had 
bunched up over rounded back 
giving her a turtle look as she 
peered at the boy through over-
sized, tinted glasses She had 
hoped that sitt ing there instead of 
behind her desk would seem 
more friendly. I t hadn't worked. 
He wouldn't sit down, just stood 
there, fingers spread out over 
hips, leather-jacketed shoulders 
back, his head turned away 

"Yer gonna fail me he slated 
flatly 

She gave up trying to catch his 
eyes and looked down Her clum-
sy space shoes looked like club 
feet. She tucked them back 
" A n g e l o , you ' ve cut e ight 
classes. ' 

He shifted his weight to the 
o the r foo t . " I g o t t a j ob . 
Sometimes the boss says 1 gotta 
come in. An I been sick. 1 got 
notes " 

She thought of several ways to 
begin, to reach him Then she 
realized that, tor once, the words 
had not come spontaneously She 
did not want to hear the words, 
famil iar, like a Formula. 'No . ' 
she thought, running her fingers 
through the wirey curls "This 
t ime, I 'm not going to say 
anything. He wants to go through 
the r i t u a l . a c c u s a t i o n s , 
definance. pleading and maybe 
an excuse to gel angr>' " 

Angelo shi f ted again and 
watted. He looked down at her A 
narrow r im of grey hair made a 
circle under the black. He wanted 
to smash something. "Ye r ha i r s 
grey, aint it? " 

Mrs Sklar felt her throat 
tighten. She pulled hersell up. 

Language f f 

"There's no point in talking " She 
walked to her desk "You've fail-
ed, " For the first time in the 
meeting, their eyes met. He look-
ed away first, 

"That 's c o o l " , he said. He 
pushed a chair toward her. The 
door slammed behind him. 

"What a stupid expression." 
she thought as she stood at her 
de jk " U t t e r l y s tupid " She 
began to erase the board. What 
did it mean? Was it one of those 
contradictory things like 'bad 
m a n " for a dynamic personality 
or "heavy" for elevating Her life 
as an English teacher had been 
built on words - yes- and images-
and symbols. Why couldn't she 
understand their language if she 
could understand Shakespeare? 
There were so few expressions 
that young people used these 
days, like robots that had a 
l imited number of phrases pro-
grammed in She stood with the 
eraser in her hand. The idea for 
an animated cartoon came to her 
L i t t le wind-up dolls, leather-
jacketed, blue-jeaned boys. Far-
rah Fawcett girls- moving in a 
square dance, piping at each 
other In monotones: "heavy", 
"coo l " . She smiled and then forc-
ed herself to stop Anyone looking 
in the door would think she was 
going crazy Thank God these 
ideas had not come toher whens 
he was teaching f i lmmaking. 
Maybe teaching composition to 
poor students was pushing her in-
to per\'ersity. She opened a desk 
drawer and took ot a bag of 
raisins and an apple She ate the 
raisins one at a time but with 
rapidity. There was a feeling in 
her stomach that pinched like 
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hunger txit was more like a desire 
to be packed and ful l . She wanted 
a warm feeling that would make 
her throat feel less choked. It 
didn't matter if anyone saw her 
sitting here, stuffing her mouth 
like a squirrel, she thought. Her 
colleagues had protiably decided 
she was senile anyway. She had 
seen their expression when she 
would speak at a department 
jneeting. Lately, she had just 
dutifully attended, tried not to 
speak, only occasionally ex-
ploding She wouldn't try to de-
fend her ideas, just retreated 
behind her glasses. Mrs Sklar cut 
the apple into neat eighths and 
t>egan to eat them methodically 
Was she "coo l " ' behind her 
glasses, she wondered May t * 
that was what Angelo had meant 
He was safely " coo l " : falling 
couldn't hurl him. Funny, when 
he had come in. she had felt sym-
pathetic. He was such a poor 
Travolta imitation. Would he 
ever guess that she had seen 
Saturday Mgh l Fever, even liked 
It When he had stood there, she 
had wanted to reach him in some 
way, offer understanding, alter-
natives But this t ime - she 
couldn't bring herself to make the 
effort. At night, after a few 
hours sleep, she would get up and 
grade papers, write long, detail-
ed comments with no sense of 
fatigue. She could walk for hours 
in the city on weekends, sit 
through obscure foreign films 
that seemed to tire younger peo-
ple. She neatly folded up the ap-
ple remains. Maytte she should 
stay home tomorrow. What was it 
the other teachers called i t . a 
menial health day Thirty-four 
years and she had not taken a 
single sick day off, conferences 
yva. oh, and her son's college 
graduation. Maybe they would 
declare it a school holiday. Mrs. 
Sklar's Honorary Cut Day She 
was smiling again After a l l . 
there wasn't anyone to see her. 
These days the teachers seem lo 
empty from the building more 
quickly than the students She 
often puttered around her room 
for hours after the last bell. She 
dumped the apple package into 
the trash can. The custodian 
would be coming soon to make his 
half-hearted effort at straighten-
ing the room. She preferred to do 
it herself. From the closet, she 
got her spray can of cleanser, 
another of her accentrieilies. She 
was one of the few teachers who 
tried to cope with the graffit i M I 
the desks No matter how careful-
ly she tried to monitor the 
students, it would appear. As she 
started to rub. she read " I give 
good ". "Sklar — ". Since she had 

given up her f i lm classes in the 
face of "back to basics " and had 
taken on composition, the graffiti 
had become cruder and there 
were more misspellings She sup-
posed i t was put there for her 
benefit, to shock her. If they only 
read current books, which they 
d idn ' t , or saw avante-garde 
fi lms, which they didn't, they 
would know, which they didn't, 
that she wasn't shocked. Just 
tired. Maytte If she had worked 
with the brighter ones again, like 
the ones who had taken f i lmmak-
ing, the graffit i would have been 
more literate But she had decid-
ed not to give up. not to retire, to 
prove she could teach right until 
the end. even basics. Perhaps she 
should change her tactics, deal 
with them at their level As she 
sprayed and scrubbed, she In-
vented course titles: "Plethora of 
P o r n o g r a p h y " . " S ex and 
Sentence Structure", '"Purient 
Reading and Writing for Begin-
ners ". "Palatable Propositions" 
Anoise made her look up. startl-
ed. A g i r l was standing in the 
doorway, a man's derby cocked 
to one side, a tent-like poncho 
covering the short round figure 
The g i r l walked in and dumped 
her knapsack on a sti l l damp 
desk. "How ya doing Mrs. Sklar? 
Where is everybody?" She rat t l -
ed on without waiting for an 
answer. " I t ' s tike a tomb here: 
just a bunch of jerks doin track in 
the basement I figured you'ld be 
around " She looked around 
"But this room always used lo be 

packed after school What's up? " 

Mrs. Sklar was embarrassed. 
She knew she had taught the g i r l 
but couldn't think of her name: 
Jean. Stacey - a boyish name -
but i t wouldn't come. "College 
vacation?", she asked, try ing to 
smile. 

"Are you kidding? ". the gir l 
answered with a laugh " I drop-
ped out of N Y U four years ago 
1 wanted to come by then and say 
hello but I was having a rough 
time with my family and didn't 
get around lo i t . " 

W i t h r e l i e f . M r s . S k l a r 
remembered her name, Austin, 
ebullient Austin. She had been 
very creative, done an animated 
f i lm with clay, worked on it in 
this room for weeks. How could 
she have forgotten? " D i d you 
ever do anything more wi th 
film? ", she asked. 

Austin again looked around the 
room before answering. Only the 
John Ford f i lm posters were the 
same No equipment out, no 
screen, no projects crowding the 
windowsills She walked around 
looking before she sat down. 
"Yeh. one of the reasons I wanted 
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'Planting Instructions"  

"Three inches deep. 
Three inches apart , " 
Bu l l ! 

Pack 'em shouMer to shoulder 
In clumps of four and five 
At the bottom of little w e l l s -

Crocus companions through the 
winter night. 

Tight friends bedded down old-
tavern style 

Under brown blanket and white 
fealher comforter 

To dream up an early spring 
Of purple, yellow, green. 
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to come back was to see you. to 
tell you about it. Rememl i ^ 
when you took us in to the New 
Filmmakers ' Festival I had a 
documentary in it this year " she 
paused ' I won." Her cockiness 
flagged for a moment. Shyly, she 
said. " I want to bring it in and 
show it to you. You know, it's fun-
ny. When I heard I won. the first 
thing that came into my head was 
you. Isn't that dumb? I don't 
mean that the way i t sounds. I 
respect your opiniwi but isn't 
dumb for me lo think of thai 
first " She paused. "Do you 
remember? You only gave me a 
" B " for the course." 

Mrs. Sklar sat down in a chair, 
the one Angelo had pushed at her 
She understood Austin Grades 
had always been important to 
Mrs, Sklar in school, not just the 
mark but what it meant about her 
as a person The same as her 
teaching record, her attendance, 
not ret i r ing. In a way, she 
thought, she was her record. 

Austin was saying. " I Unvk v . 
learned more from you than any 
teacher in college, even though I 
was getting "A 's ". 1 guess that's 
why I dropped out. 1 figured I had 
to grade myse l f " 

Mrs. Sklar took off her glasses; 
she only needed them for reading 
anyway, and looked at Austin. 
She didn't know what to say 

Austin laughed nervously, " I 
talk too much, 1 guess. But what's 
wrong wi th you? You were 
always talking a mile a minute. 
Did I get you at a bad t ime?" 

Mrs Sklar stood up and laugh-
ed. She liked this g i r l . 'No. it 's a 
good t i m e " , she said. She put her 
glasses in her smock pocket and 
picked up the cleanser. Austin 
reached for the can. "You want 
me to do that? We a l l used to help 
clean up after a session." 

"No . " . Mrs. Sklar said. " I was 
just going to throw it away." 

Austin picked up her bag. 
"Shall I bring the f i lm In next 
week' '" 

" I won't be here anymore but 
call me at home, please". Mrs. 
Sklar said. 

Austin let the bag drop to the 
floor, "you. retire - and m the 
middle of the year! They used to 
say the building would go before 
sklar . What w i l l you do with 
yourse l f " 

Mrs. Sklar touched her hair, 
'"let it go gray for one th ing , " 
Suddenly she knew that that was 
important. She wondered why. 
That was another thing she would 
have to do. find out why. She look-
ed at Austin for a reaction. 

•That's cool ", Austin said 
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A r thur B o y k i n s 
Arthur Boykins passed away Monday morning, December 7, 1981, in an 

automobile accident. Arthur was very talented and ambitious. He wanted to 
be a cosmetician and went to BOCES to learn the trade so he could one day 
open his own shop. For many of you who did not know what kind of person 
Arthur was, let me tell you for he was a close personal friend of mine. 

I knew him for the last three years. He was like my brother for we lived 
together in the same group home. He was not selfish. He never did anything to 
hurt anyone. Henevergot in trouble. He would always give something before 
he would receive something. You would say that he was quiet,that he was 
outgoing, that he was flexible, that he was never demanding, that he was 
understanding. He would put you ahead of himself every time. He liked to get 
involved with your ideas as well as his own. He was never the type of person to 
complain about things. He liked everybody and everybody bked h im. He 
respected everyone and because of that everyone respected h im. 

He can not be replaced ... 
He was one of a kind ... 
I think that he would want you to remember that i f i t could happen to h im, 

thinking of the kind of person he was, i t could happen to anybody. So before 
you do anything, you should always think. K i rk Bunn 

The Schreiber Times wishes to express condolences to the family and friends 
of Arthur Boykins. We share in your sympathy and sorrow that this tragedy 
occured. We would also like to extend best wishes to Farre l Gordon for his 
recovery. 

L a k e McGregor 
As we al l have unfortunately heard, our fellow friend and student Luke 

McGregor has suffered a serious accident. Luke is presently in Rusk Institute 
of Rehabilitation Medicine Center where he is receiving the best professional 
help in the hopes that he w i l l make the greatest amount of progress possible. 
With Luke's determination and his family and friends right behind h im, Luke 
wi l l hopefully have the strength to overcome some of his difficulties. 

On Dec. 18 there w i l l be a benefit dance for Luke which wi l l feature the band 
Deep River. The dance w i l l start at 8:00 P.M. and end at 11:00 P.M.; 
admission is $5.00 per person. The money w i l l be donated to the McGregor 
f^^^'y- Tom McCarvi l l 

l a F a v * r of Chess C l ab 
At the most recent G.O. meeting there was heated controversy and a close vote 

over a motion to contribute $20 to the Schreiber Chess Club. We, the editors of the 
Schreiber Times, feel that the vote in favor of the motion was appropriate and 
that the position of those opposing the motion was hypgcritical or their a r g u -
ments simply didn't apply. 

The oppositions argument seemed to hinge pr imari ly on the administration's 
refusal to fund the Port hockey team. The administration refused to fund the 
hockey team not for fiscal reasons, but because statistically hockey is a 
dangerous sport. This could hardly be said of the Chess Club In addition, the 
authority supplying funds in the case of theOiess Club is not the administration, 
but the Student Government. Those who wish to scream "inconsistent pol icy" 
w i l l have to look elsewhere. 

For those who contend that the lacrosse team must buy their own uniforms, the 
chess club sought funds to be used solely for team membership in the Nassau 
County Interscholastic Chess League. As Ethan Halm, spokesman for the Chess 
Club, so eloquently put i t , ' i t ' s not like we're buying gold chess pieces." I t 's not 
like they're buying chess pieces period. Every other school interscholastic 
organization has its league dues paid for by the administration. Should the Chess 
Club be treated differently? We think not. 

It 's also noteworthy that the Lat in Club received $50 from a benevolent G.O., a 
$50 that was to be used for a closed celebration. This is not to mention the almost 
ceremonial $120 that the G.O. unanimously voted to give the Yearbook 
Committee. For these reasons we cannot accept the argument that the Chess 
Club should have been denied it 's humble request. We are glad that the majority 
of the GO. agreed 
Poor P lanBing Canses Confl icts 

On at least two occasions during this school year, afterschool activities have 
been poorly organized. For weeks or months there may be no special events 
scheduled at the school and then suddenly two activities are held on the same 
night. There doesn't seem to be any reason why the organizers of after school 
presentations cannot make sufficient arrangements so only one event occurs on 
a night. 

Students were presented with a conflict on Nov. 20 when "Rosencrantz and 
Guilderstern Are Dead" was held in the autitorium and the boys' gymnastics 
meet was held in the gymnasium. Should the students choose to go to one and not 
the other? Should they leave one early and go to the other late? There is not such 
an overload of afterschool events that the students should not be able to see both 
in their entirety. 

Students can look forward to making another unwelcome choice on Dec. 18 when 
the Dance for Luke McGregor is being held along with the performance of the 
Kaleria Fedicheva's New School of Russian Ballet. Why should students have to 
choose between supporting a fellow student and seeing a dance troupe which 
includes two Schreiber students, Betsy Copperwhite and Christina Colyvas, 
perform? 

We the editors of The Schreiber Times feel that, not only would i t be to the 
advantage ot the students, but it would be in the best interests of the school to 
schedule performances on separate nights. Student attendance would increase if 
they could go to ona event one week and another the next, as w.ould profits. 

Letters 
Stolen A r t w o r k 

T o the Ed i to r : 

It took a week and a half to 
complete bul seconds to steal 
Alone with other a r t pieces, it 

was on display so that ail of 
Schreiber could enjoy. Now i l is 
only enjoyed by the person who 
stole it. (Stolen from the ma in 
lobby w a s a n a s s i g n m e n t 
completed for my advert is ing 
c lass , a poster ot J i m Morrison.) 
It was to be used as a finished 
piece for a portfolio needed to 
enter college. Now i t i s g o n e a n d l 
a m angry! 

The poster was first reported 
m i s s i n g at a r e c e n t a r e 
exhibit/demonstration. A Publ ic 
A d d r e s s a n n o u n c e m e n t w a s 
promptly made but to no ava i l . I 
have contacted a l l the d isc i -
pl inary heads bul they have been 
of no help. My artwork is just like 
any other personal property 
stolen in-school, yet no one has 
done anything about recovering 
it. 

Although there is a suspect , he 

or she wil l not be questioned a s 
the teachers •don't want to 
accuse anybody. " I don't believe 
anyone should be accused either, 
but I wil l not allow this issue to be 
dropped I spent a lot of my time 
on that J i m Morrison poster and 
il was very beautiful; how can I 
just give up? 

I a m sorry to say thai this 
incident has real ly given me a 
dim view of some Schreiber 
students. Never again wil l a piece 
ot my artwork be displayed in 
this school 1 cannot afford any-
more portfolio candidates to be 
stolen Betore 1 end I would also 
l ike express my disappointment 
in the a d m i n i s t r a t o r s of 
Schreiber. Th i s incident has 
proven them to be incompetent 
and unsympathetic. The only 
support I received was from the 
art department and I thank them. 
Otherwise, this had been a bad 
experience and one not easi ly 
forgotten. 

S i n c e r e l y , 

E i l e e n Connelly 

R o l l i n g Wr i t e r H a s a F l a i r 

T o the Editor : 

A Cross You Should Bear (At 
Leas t , a B i d 

Editor ia l letter wr i ter Stephen 
B r i n k m a n complained, in the 
November 18 issue, of his Eng l i sh 
teacher 's pencil ban. Steve is 
right brothers - he does have a 
pijint in this pencil push. 

If more students got the lead 
out of their jeans . Schreiber-
writing would be a shade lighter 
and. s ince 1 cart home at>out two 
pounds of quizzes, tests, and 
essays each evening, my load 
would lessen i No? i . 

To support pencil pal S i eve ' s 
b i cke r ing . I 'd even recommend 
that students use No. 3 lead. Then 
the redundancies, fragments. 

for Re i i a t t a l s 
loose sentences, and awkward 
phrases would be less visible to 
us picky-picky Eng l i sh teachers. 
What we couldn't see. we couldn't 
fault. A l l o f those flowing writera 
would become flowing writers 
when the i r t e c h n i c a l 
transgressions begin (o blend into 
the blankness of their thinking. 

We teachers of Eng l i sh are not 
marr ied to our E r a s e r Ma les : 
nor a re we fraternal with our 
Write Bros. : we can change. Sure , 
we' l l probably need the newst 
sofi lenses to see the sotlty 
written scr ipt , but it God had 
wanted teachers to see. he would 
have given them pupils 

Regretfnlly yours . 
Robert Albert 
Teacher of 

S lephen Br inkman 

'Mental W iza rds ' Wa lk Among Us 

To the Ed i to r : 
The pec^le in this school never 

fail to a m a z e me. So the 3-D 
movie was not Oscar mater ia l . It 
stil l could have been a fun even-
ing 1 realized, in between the 
iewd remarks of the audience, 
that there a re people in this 
school whose mental ages are 
less than their grade point 
averages. I 'm talking about 
mental maturity. Intellectually, 
these people must be geniuses; 
anyone who can find something 
obscene to shout about The 
i ' reature Walks Among I s must 
b e a mental wizardl 

T h a n k f u l l y , only a s m a l l 
percent age of the audience was 
act ing in this "h ighly sophisti-
c a t e d " manner I real ly didn't 

think that people could shout 
disgusting statements for 2 solid 
hours. I was wrong: did they ever 
persevere! It d i d n l take the res l 
of the audience long before they 
too were irritated by these 
troublemakers. 

Granted, the movie wasn ' t 
extremely captivating, bul i l was 
a courageous attempt by the 
.Student Government, tobr ingthe 
student body together. It 's loo 
l « d lhat a sma l l group of people 
can defeat the whole purpose of 
an activity. I hope thai in the 
future these people wil l sho* ' 
some respect for Ihe rights of 
others. 

Res pe*.'t fully. 
Jennifer Honen 

T h e Sch re i b e r T i m f t 
P u b h s h e d hv Ihe S l u d e n l i of 

P a u l [> S rh rp i be r H igh School 
P n n Wash inK lo r . N V 11U50 
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S u u E i H a iken 

K u i h S c h e r 
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Youth Center Two Schreiber Students to Dance the Nutcracker 

(Continued from page 1) 

M o t s B» Or ly H t l O M 

Mr i . V*r4*<l HIna i j d d n t l l n i youth 
eanlar m H I I n t con earn In) ScKral-
iMr ' i i t l a r - i c t loB l ipor t i prof r i m . 

Thomas Piccininni, a resident of 
Port who teaches for the City in 
the Bronx, was concerned " tha t 
there is nothingforkids, "saying, 
" the gyms are at night, Ihe 
kids have nothing to do." Mrs. 
Verdell Hines. Schreiber's acting 
Dean of Students who also 
attended the meeting, informed 
Mr Piccinmni that Mr. Romeo's 
reorganization of the Schreiber 
a th l e t i c o rogram has 
approximately M % of the school 
population participating in some 
sort of after school sport, whether 
team or i n t r a m u r a l . M r , 
Piccininni reiterated his cal l for 
district gyms to be kept open at 
night for the youth of Port Wash-
ington to utilize. 

The most informed person at 
the meeting was Gus Potter, who 

talked in terms of a center to 
serve the youth in Port Washing-
ton and not the ent i re 
community. He told everyone 
that Port already had two youth 
centers with the existence of the 
Police Athletic League and L i t t ig 
House, and that a new youth 
center would not help the 
problem on the minds of many 
people at the meeting, that <rf 
existing juvenile delinquency. He 
stated that youths who are 
destructive do not spend their 
leisure t ime in youth centers and 
that since 1968 when Port Wash-
ington led the county in juvenile 
offenses, the rate has continued 
to decline each year w i th Port 
being ranked second lowest for 
1980 Mr. Potter, whom virtually 
everyone at the meeting includ-
ing students knew as "Gus." told 
thoee at the forum that Ihe 
successful youth centers in the 
county are run by students with 
adult supervision in financial 
mat t e rs . He also in formed 
everyone that some communities 
such as Glen Cove, which had its 
center burned to the ground, have 
met with total failure. After pre-
senting his case against a center 
because he did not see the need, 
Gus informed the community 
leaders he would work with them, 
whatever their decision. 

The meeting ended without any 
master plan for the youth center 
except for the inventory of com-
mun i t y services being 
coordinated by Mr Meier, and 
the student survey being planned 
by Anthony Scaramucci. Further 
action by the community mem-
bers wi l l depend on the feedbadt 
they receive from the students 
and organizat ions in the 
community. 

by OanlalW L x l n 

The Nutcracker Ballet w i l l be 
a' Schreiber on December 18th at 
8 p.m. Tickets wil l be available at 
Ihe door. The tickets cost $6.00 for 
adults and $3.00 for children and 
senior citizens. 

The p r inc ip l e dancer is 
Christina Colyvas. a senior now 

attending Schreiber. A Schreiber 
junior, Betsy Copperwhite. is also 
a dancer in the ballet. Both 
Christina and Betsy are pari of 
Ka le r ia Fed i chevas dance 
company. 

Christina has been dancing for 
eight years and has been with the 

company for one year. She plans 
to go to a two year college and 
major in dance. Betsy has been 
dancing for seven years. 

Both girls have been danc-
ing over four hours a day in 
preparation for the Nutcracker, 
and both girls are considering a 
career in dance. 

A Comparison of SAT Prep Courses 
by Matt H i iKan 

As most juniors know, the SAT 
wi l l be offered on May l,June 5, 
1982. In recent years, preparat im 
for the test, individually and wi th 
professional help, has tiecome in-
creasingly popular. SAT ;»'ep 
courses are now being offered by 
private individuals, small busi-
nesses, and targe companies. In 
choosing a SAT course, the stu-
dent must decide which aspect of 
preparation for the test is most 
important for him. 

SAT courses can be divided in 

one way by the size of the study 
group. One-to-one instruction 
offers an intensive, h igh ly 
individualized program which 
focuses on a student's specific 
weaknesses. However, in addi-
tion to being very personal, one-
to-one instruction tends to be 
very expensive. Small groups, 
anywhere from three to twelve, 
offer less individual attention, 
but include the benefit of group 
dynamics and mot i va t i on . 
Larger groups, of twenty or 

more, provide even less indivi-
dual help, but do a fine job of 
teaching test-taking techniques 
and giving lots of practice with 
sample questions. The price 
range of intermediate and larger 
groups varies greatly. 

Al l of the course offered stress 
one thing-the student wi l l get out 
of the course what he puts into i t 
Homework is a basic part of 
every p r i ^ r a m and so a student 
must be wil l ing to work in order 
to succeed on the test. 
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We'll lease you 
any car you 

ever dreamed 
about driving. 

Long and short term leasing. Call today for more 
information from our leasing experts. 

5 1 6 - 4 8 2 - 7 7 0 0 
^4 million cars sold & serviced since 1929 

PONTIAC / DATSUN 
795 Northern Blvd.Great Neck, N.Y. 11021 
Sales (516) 482-7700/Service 482-7704 



Rosencrantz and GuiMenstem 
A Success 

Despite The Lights 
by S u u n ( J l l m j n 

foi i j ir i i lul iHnuu; to everyone 
w ho helped wi l h Schreiber's 
prixliictiotis on November 20th 
and 2lsl of Tom Stoppards play 
•"K(»encranlz and Guildenslem 
are Dead." I I was a tremendous 
success Irom starl lo Tmish The 
play opened with a fanlaslic 
display of Shakespearean 
tosiumes and ended with a 
thought provoking sololoquy The 
middle was even better because 
of the talented acting done by 
Jonathan Goldstein, Peler 
Koyston, Danny Kraker. and 
Tom Gullo. 

' Goldstein and Royslon. who 
plaved Rosencrantz and 
Guildenslem, respectively, have 
• never before acted so well. They 
are no longer r igid actors going 
through set motions; instead, 
they use their imagination in 
their c lowning. Each 
performance and rehearsal was 
different because Goldstein and 
Rovston strayed from the script. 
They do this professionally, 
without getting confused or 
hesitating. For example, in one 
performance RoserKrantz said 
"but surely ," and Guildenslem 

replied with a quick " D o n I call 
me Shirley." which set the 
audience laughing, txjt could 
never be mentioned in the script 
because of the time era. Some 
viewers thought Goldstein and 
Royston •went a bit overboard " 
or 'hammed it up too much " with 
their dramatic gestures and 
inserted lines, 

Danny Kraker was marvelous 
in his role of ' The Player." This 
was the first time Kraker made a 
noticeable impression on the 
audience, l^s voice, movements, 
and facial expressions were very 
eUecUve. He " d i e d " very 
convincingly and tl>en sprang up 
to take a bow for his excellent 
acting which, of course, set the 

audieiH'O giggling again. 
Tom Gullo stole the show 

whenever lie was on stage with 
his performance as "A l f r ed . " In 

"the play within the play ' Gullo 
had to dress up as Queen 
Gertrude i A my M i Her i The 
audience could not stop laughing 
as he scruf fed around, picking his 
nose Gullo's size and motions, 
were so markedly in contrast 
with Miller's dainty self that the 
effect was perfect,. 

The major f law in the 
production lay with the lighting 
crew, not with the actors. The 
lights are sui^osed to fade 
throughout the final scene unti l 
there is only a head-sized 
spotlight on Guildenslem Well, 
when the lighting switched from 
stage lights to a man-sized 
spotlight from the projection 
room there was a slip up A huge, 
bright, spotlight which covered 
the entire stage flashed on and 
was subsequently reduced to the 
required size amongst many 
audible cries from the projection 
room includinga panicked "Oh, -
- , " Needless to say the audience 
went into hysterics. But this was 
not the end of the lighting c rews 
embarrassment, Guildensterns 
final line begins iwi th a spotlight 
on his head) "Now you see me, 
now you ,., (and the lighLs blacks 
out). Well, the light stayed on and 
we sti l l saw him as the light was 
flung ceiling ward to mask his 
exit 

Contrary to the beliefs of the 
actors atid some viewers, the 
l i ght ing crew d id not k i l l 
' R o s e n c r a n t z a n d 

Guildenstemr" the play was sti l l 
impressive. Congratulations to 
the cast. crew, and especially to 
the director. Ms. Susan Patt, The 
performance was a far step up 
from last year's play "The 
Alchemist." 

Winter Concert Features Band, Orchestea, Choir 
by R l c t l l i a K l l i n * ' 

The Orchestra. Choir and Band 
joined forces Surxlay. December 
13th at 3p.m in the school audi-
torium tor the annual Winter 
Concert. 

First to perform was the 
orchestra, under the direction of 
Mr Mooney. They began with 
"Ayes and Dances for Strings ' 
composed by John Dowland The 
"Presto" movement from Hay-
den's "Acide E Galatea" was 
played. Selected 
members of the band then joined 
the orchestra to put the •Dixie" 
in the "Maple Leaf Rag." a Scott 
Joplin piece, 

Jennifer Spielman sang, 
"Since You've Asked, ' a contem-
porary piece. 

They were followed bv _llie 
choir singing. "O Come Em* 
manuel, " Although most of the 
performers to<* their place in 
front of the audience, a small sec-
tion stayed in the back. This pro-
vided the effect of an echo for 
Orlando di Lasso's " 0 L^, O Che 
Buon Eco ' They sang three 
more selections and were joined 
by a string ensemble for their last 
scheduled piece. 'Regina Coeli, 
K276," by Mozart, 

The program concluded wi th 
the band playing four selections 
conducted by Mr . Fish. They 
opened wi th "Colwiel Bogey. 
March , " 
Following "The Thunderer" was 
Borodin's 'Symphony No 1 

ROBERT M I L L E n 
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Grossman To Represent U.S. 
Amy Grossman, when selected 

to represent the United States in 
ihc Junior World Championship 
by the linJted Slates Figure 
.Skating Association <USFAi. 
received a break that w i l l 
probably change her l i fe , 
Grossman, a junior, recently 
lound out that she and her 
partner. Rob Davenport of the 
Bronx, wi l l be leaving along with 
S I X other American ice skaters to 
go to Oberstdorf, West Germany 
on Deceml>er 9th. 

Their selection to represent the 
U.S. in world competition came 
as a surprise to Grossman as she 
has never competed as a pairs 
skater and she and her partner 
have only skated together since 
June of this year. They wi l l 
compete against the top skaters 
from the Soviet Union, Great 
Britain, Canada. Japan, and 
Austria, among others. 

Although they were surprised 
to be picked because of their 
inexperience in competion, they 
are by no means strangers to the 
sport. Amy has been skating 
since she was 8 years old and her 
experiences include a two month 
training period in California with 
the coach of Tai Babitonia and 
Tfandy Gardner Rob has also 
tieen skating s i iKe he was young 
and each day he and Amy go 
through an exhausting schedule. 
Amy wakes up at 4:50 a m , and is 
out of the house by 5:30 a,m on 

Nissen and Gombach 
To Be "Lovers" 

bv P * l * r R o y i l o n 

After long, pain-staking try-
outs, the cast for levers , the 
Drama Department's Winter 
production, has been set. The 
play, by Brian Fr ie l . is broken 
into two one-act plays. Winners 
and l ^ e r s . The first. Winners, is 
the poignant story of Joe i Peter 
Nissen) and Maggie ( L i z 
Gomhachi, a young couple who 
must be married, as Maggie is 
pregnant The play is narrated by 
a man and a woman iGary 
Schanzer and Jenny Sumerman i , 
The second play. Losers, is more 
of a comedy, telling the tale of 
Andy ^Dave Dwyer) and Hanna 
(Hi l lary Kahn). as a middle-aged 
couple in love, who must contend 
with two old spinsters (Judy 
Renfrew and Eva Oslerburg) 
who tr> to hinder their happiness 

Lovers is slated for perform-
ance on January 22 and 23. 
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her way lo rinks in 
Flushing, Nyack or Stratford. 
Connecl ic i i l .She leaves the 
nnk.'- early enough to be back at 
Schreiber by 10:30 a m 
Sometimes she and Rob skate 
tw ice a day and ihey run through 
tbeirschedulcTdaysa week 

Before Amy met Rob. the most 
compatible partner she has ever 
had . she • was seriously 
consider i ng droppi ng ska t i ng 
But titen a coach who knew Amy 
and Rob mututal ly. introduced 
them 

Rob and Amy's goals for the 
cmnpetit ion aren't that high 

"We've never even gone through 
our whole routine perfectly in 
practice If we do it perfectly in 
competition I 'd be ecstatic." 
Amy said. 

Although they realize that their 
chances of placing are not good, 
they believe that simply being in 
1 he compet i t ion w i l l be an 
important stepping stone if they 
decide lo continue. Exposuire on 
an international level can't hurt 
their chances in the upcoming 
Eastern Uni ted Stales 
competition and the National 
Competition in Indianapolis in 
which they are both entered. 
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Whitman, St. Mary's, Sour 
Boys' B-Ball Debut 

by Ton i M c C l r v l l l 

On Friday, December I I , and 
Saturday, December 12. Ihe 
Schreiber VVarsity Basketball 
Team participated in the annual 
Man basset Tournament, The 
lournament featured four 
separate teams, each playing a 
game a night. On Friday. Port 
lost to the overpowering Wall 
Whitman team by Ibe score of 89 
to 43, This toss eliminated Port 
from the championship game and 
left the Port team battling for 
Ibird place in a consolation game. 

The following night Port was 
defeated by St. Marys after a 
close, well fought game. Tbe 
game ended in a score (^49 to 52 
It was won in the last 25 seconds 
as a result of key foul shooting by 
the St. Marys team Tbe highlight 
player of tbe game for Port was 
James Abercrombie who finished 

the game as the high scorer with 
28 points. Although Port finished 
fourth, they proved that they 
have the potential to improve and 
become a winning team. 

Preview 
The Varsity Basketball team is 

looking to better their 7-5 season 
record of last year The learn wi l l 
be seriously Nndered by the loss 
of its star player. K i rk Bunn At a 
meeting between the league 
coaches it was determined that 
Kirk was ineligible to play for 
Schreiber The team returnees 
are 5 1 1 " senior guard Jeff 
Dumpeon. 5 U " junior guard 
Matt Moro, 6'5" senior center 
Mark Carr, and G'2'" junior for-
ward James Abercrombie, who 
averaged 18 points a game last 
year The team is under the new 
leadership of Head Coach M r 
Herb Sonderickers. 

n i o l o by Or ly Nudal 
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Football Rnishes 

With A 4-4 Record 
by J ( t l l lo thcnBerq 

This years Port Washington 
Varsity Football team ended its 
year with a disappointing four 
wins and four loses. This was 
good enough for a tie for third in 
their division, but many people 
thought this team would be one of 
the leagues best challenger for 
Ihe league title The coach Mr . 
Biro was also disappointed, and 
fell the team lost a lot <rf games 
that could havegone either way. 

Winning individual honors this 
year for Port were Pat Doyle and 
Kenny Renga who were picked to 
the Oridiron Fifty-Five which is 
picked by the division coaches 
and honors the fifty-five top 
players in Port Washington's 
d iv i s ion , Pat Doyle was a 
linebacker and was among (he 
team leaders in lackles Kenny 
Kenga slarred for tbe offersive 
team as a running back. Other 
players playing well this year 
were Terra nee Rafferty and 
Kelly Kilcrease 

Next year's team wi l l rely 
heavily on this years Junior 
Varsity team because only ten 
out of forty Varsity players are 
returning. Next ypar's team wi l l 
re ly heavi ly on Terrance 
Kafferly on defense and John 
Shapiro on (rffense other people 
returning next year are Ron 
Musslewhi le and Chuck 
tireenspan 

V-Ball Beaten 
in Playoffs 

by S«ri i i c n r l i t and Sua H i l l u n 

After a winning season with a 
final record of 13-6 the girls" 
volleyball team was defeated by 
Oceanside in the second game of 
tbe playoffs. The team played 
extremely well throughout both 
games, but the lough competition 
and the inten.se pressure kepi 
Porl from winning the game. 

An apparently inferior Ocean-
side team was led by one or two 
outstanding players to whom 
the ir v i c t o r y should be 
attributed. 

Oceanside pulled ahead reight 
away despite strong plaving bv 
the whole Port team, Beth Kelly 

• and Denise Zahn once again 
showed tremendous teamwork 
with their "famous" set and 
spike plays Caroline Tolley and 
Denise Zahn displayed superior 
serving enabling Port to gain a 
number of points 

The leam had an excellent 
season and should be commended 
on their superior playing wihich 
brnught them through the first 
round of the playoffs. 
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TELEPHONE FOR S P E C I A L R E D U C E D F A R E S 
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Girls' B-Ball Hopeful 
by Cl l r l i D o y I * 

The Varsity Girls Basketball 
team expects the 1981 season to 
be at least as successful as last 
year 8-4 record. The coach Mr. 
Sphicos says. " W e should 
definitely qualify for the playoffs 
and t>e considered a dark horse 
for the conference •• Coach 
Sphicos has great enthusiasm for 
new varsity players Pat McPart-
land and Cathy Wood, •(m 
hoping the new inexperienced 
varsity members blend together 
because their talents are strong.' ' 
Returning varsity player Lyssi 
Dver confirms and adds, " I think 
this year's enthusiasm is greater 
than last year's. We have good 
teamwork and everyone gets 
along w e l l . " 

The offensive power w i l l 
generate mainly with Theresa 
McLean and Stacey Hoffman 

Return ing vars i ty p layer 
.Stephaine McCurty is a strong 
defensive player. Mr , Sphicos 
believes, '•Our biggest weakness 
wil l be our scoring power and 
varsity inexperience Without 
any more injuries we should be 
good contenders for the 
playoffs," 

Injured Carmella Mongelluzzo 
is a great dissapointment and 
loss to Ihe team. Varsity senior 
Stacie Waltenberg admi ts , 
•"unforhinately we lost Carmella 
and another player. The best 
thing about the leam is that we al l 
get along well together There is 
a lot of individual talent but I 
have a feeling it wi l l blend." 

The team wil l play two non-
league games t>efore their first 
league game on Dec 22 against 
Great Neck North. 
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Awards Dinner 
Honors Fall Athletes 

(Continued from page 8) 

Capriello. Patrick Doyle. Kelly 
Kilcrease. Ken Renga. and junior 
Terrence Rafferty Head Coach 
Dan Biro and Assistant coaches 
Jack Weickel and Mike Zirpolo 
col1atx>rated on presenting Ken 
Renga with the Leo Costello 
Award This award is presented 
annual ly to the outstanding 
player on the Varsity Team. And 
Patrick Doyle was given the 
Coach's Award. Both players 
have played three years on the al l 
county division leam. and Doyle 
participated in the all-star foot-
ball game at C W Post College. 

Boys Cross Country had a try-
ing season with very difficult 
compet i t ion Coach Acevedo 
named senior Skip Canfield as 
the undoubted team leader and 
presented him with the Most 
Valuable Player Award Canfield 
and junior Chris Forrest were al l 
conference runners. The Coach's 
Award was given to senior Mike 
Christiansen. 

Boys Varsity Soccer may not 
have had a winning season but 
they certainly had a winning 
spirit The coach. Rc^er Winter, 
was very proud of the team's am-
bition in spite of their difficult 
competition Junior Jeff K i l l and 
senior John I>oyle were given the 
Coach's Award. Senior John Diaz 
was presented the Most Valuable 
Player Award, And EJoyle was 
also given tbe Joseph Rezek Soc-
cer Award for outstanding abi l i -
ty, sportsmanship, and scholar-
ship. 
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For the 3rd consecutive year 
the Boys Varsity Gymnastics 
T e a m was the unde feated 
Champion. The entire team earn-
ed the title as Nassau County 
D i v i s i o n Champs And two 
seniors. Steven Butcher and 
Team Captain Harns Stalis were 
State Champions, The coach, 
Tom Edgerton presented junior 
Matt Hiller with the Most I m -
proved Gymnast Award. 

Getting back to girls sports, the 
Girls Varsity Tennis Team f in-
ished the season as third in their 
division. Coach Stan Makover 
commended al l the girls on their 
abi l i ty He presented seniors 
Nancy and Lisa Stem, who are 
now ranked as second doubles 
leam m the sUte. tbe 1981 
Coach's Award. 

The evening was brought to an 
end when Miss Stephanie Joan-
non. coach of the Girls Varsity 
Soccer Team, proudly spoke of 
her team's 15 wins and 2 losses. 
The team finished its season as 
sixth in the county. Every team 
member showed excellent abi l i -
ty Sophomore Cathy Wood, 
junior Karen Skinner, and fresh-
man Er in Maguire were al l coun-
ty players Seniors Susan Rai-
mondo and Susan Gagen. and 
junior Stacey Hcrffman were a l l 
Conference players. Wood was 
number six top scorer in the 
county and was presented with 
the Most Valuable Player Award. 
Mary-Jane Apr i l , one of three 
leam captains, was given the 
Coach's Award. 

http://inten.se


Boys' Gymnastics Takes Counties 
^ By Jon B i r u c n ^ n d y C i r r u t n c r i 

lu 
S II was just like the Green Bay 
g Packers holding Vince Lombardi 
1 over Iheir heads m a Ihr i l l of vic-
cn lorv. Only this time the leam and 
^ the sport was different and it 
I - wasn't Vinee Lombardi being 
' held up. it was coach Thomas 

(D Edgerlon up in the air under the 
2 support of his 1981 gymnastics 
ID' team who had jusi captured (he 
.. 198! County Team Championship. 
J Al the start of the season Mr, 
i Edgerton had said the team had 
^ the potential and talent to win the 
^ championship, but it was up to 
•g Ifie gymnasts to work hard and 
Skeep a good altitude. Despite 
•g winning their first few meets they 
£ were slow in reaching their peak. 

They overcame al l these prob-
lems, eventually, and began to 
improve with each meet and went 
8-0, captur ing Ihe Divisional 
Championships. They were hap-
py to capture this championship, 
but they would not be 100% con-
tent unt i l they went out and cap-
t u r e d the County T e a m 
Championship which had eluded 
them for the past four years. 
They didn't want to make it five 

Much more confident than last 
year the team who was hosting 
the meet wanted to prove to the 
crowd and themselves thai they 
deserved to be the champions. 
The warm-ups came to a close 
and al l the teams gathered into 
the wrestling room. The crowd 
rose to their feel and out marched 
Captain Haris Stalis holding the 
American Flag Following behind 
were Massapequa. Plainedge. 
Oyster Bay. and Port Wash-
ington. The National Anthem 
sounded and when the last note 
was played the meet was ready to 
begin. 

The meet began with each 
team working on a different 
event. As the meet went on the 
Port Fan support grew louder 
More than half way through the 
meet the scores were announced. 
Port had a ten-point lead over its 
closest opponent, Oyster Bay. 
Not letting any of this go to the 
heads of his gymnasts, Mr . 
Edgerton had team members 
slay in the small gym after each 
phase, or while I hey were not 
competing, to calm themselves 
down Throughout the night one 
could see by the expressions on 
Mr, Edgerlon's face that he 
wanted this victory badly. As 
the fourth phase began Mr. 
Edgerton looked at his vaulters 
and yelled out, "Awright , Let's 
g o " 

Phase 5 of the meet began wi th 
the enthusiastic Port fans cry ing 
a " L e t s GO P o r f cheer. This 
was the last phase and when it 
was over it appeared that Oyster 
Bay could be very close to Por l . 
The crowd and the teams waited 
for the announcing of the winner, 
but before this was done Ihe 
handing out of individual awards 
was done. Matt Hiller, Haris 
Stalis, Steven Butcher, Cesar 
Lorenza, Adam Honen and Jon 
Fields al l received awards for 
Port for their outstanding per-
formances Then the moment 
thai everyone had been wait ing 
for occurred. The team scores 
were announced. Port had won. 
Haris Stalis held the trophy high. 
"This was a teair effort and we 
were awesome." he said; and 
Robert Eaton said, " I t ' s un-
believable. " This was the team's 
moment and nobody was going to 
take it way from them Con-
gratulations! 

State Championships 
Three members of Schreiber's 

ma le gymnast ics team par-
ticipated in the 21st Annual New 
York State Intersectional Gym-
n a s t i c s C h a m p i o n s h i p s at 
Sachem High School in Suffolk 
County on the first Saturday in 

i J i i i ' i n h f r IWI 01 the Ih r i v , 
Sleven Butcher and Jell ChenK. 
both seniors, and Mal l Hiller. a 
junior only Hil ler advanced to the 
Imal round. 
Representing Section 8 i Nassau 

( iHinty i ot tne New York Stale 
P u b l i c H i g h School 
AthleiicAssociation were nine 
gymnasts, three from Por l . Iwo 
from Oyster Bay (notably Stu 
Schiffman who cleaned up al the 
County C h a m p i o n s h i p s at 
Schreiber last week, winning 
some half-a-dozen medals and 
first place in the all-around com-
petition!, two from Baldwin, one 
from Farmingale. and one from 
Freeport The coach of Ihe Sec-
tion a leam was Mr. Baker. Ihe 
gymnastics coach from Oyster 
Bay. and the assistant coach for 
the Section 8 team was a Mr. 
B laumul l e r . Ihe gymnast ics 
coach from Baldwin The Section 
8 team was originally lo be coach-
ed by Mr. Tom Edgerton of 
Schreiber. but as Chairman of the 
New York Slate Gymnastics 
Committee Mr Edgerton's t ime 
was severely l imited 

Jeff Cheng was the first of 
Port's gymnasts to perform at 
Sachem. His init ial score in Ihe 
floor exercise was a solid 7,55 of 
of a possible 10.00, and left Jeff 
contented, "The spring-board 
floor was good." commented 
Cheng, noting that Schreiber 
doesn't have one Apparently a 
spring-board floor enables a 
gymnast to do certain moves thai 
he she might not otherwsie be 
able lo do. With his score. Jeff 
placed 9th out of twenty-lwo com-
petitors, falling a mere 1 10 of a 
point short of Blh place. Only the 
first eight finishers in each event 
move on to the finals. 

Second lo p e r f o r m for 
Schreiber was Matt Hil ler on Ihe 
rings, the only Schreiber Junior 
on the team and also the only 
Schreiber gymnast to go lo the 
finals. Matt scored a 6,25. a score 
deserving of respect in light of 
the general ly conservative 
scores given by the judges in this 
event. Armed with his 6,25. Malt 

soundly defeated the infamous 
Stu Schiffman who put on a shab-
by performance throughout Ihe 
competition. In Ihe final round, 
having captured 8th place in the 
prel iminary round. Hil ler receiv-
ed a score of 5,64. thereby reaffir-
ming his eighth place position in 
the stale.The only other junior to 
rank in the lop eight on the rings 
was Mike Ambrozy of Rocky 
Point. New York who placed first 
with a 9.3. The dude is likely to be 
trouble for Hil ler next year. 

Steven Butcher performed last 
on the long horse vault but did not 
place in IhetopeiKhl His s tnm. 
showing in Ihe counties, scoring; 
an H.5. was reason for oplimi.sm, 
hul Bucher sultered a pulled 
muscle in his neck during his lasi 
practice vault, only moments 
before he was lo compete 
Neither of the allernales. John 
Kields or Adam Honen. both of 
Porl . were called in. On Monday, 
however. Bulcher could be seen 
wearing a neck brace. His seem-
ingly high score of 7.95 didn' l 
pove lo be strong enough for the 
finals, probably because the 
judges in Ihis event had been giv-
ing out fair ly l iberal scores 
throughout Ihe meet. Steve was 
reluclani lo at lnbule his failure 
to make the finals lo the injury 

M a t o by M i r k O u i n * 
St**« Butc iwr par lorrnt on I M pommal horM during ina C o u n t y Ct iamplon-
•hlp. 

Awards Dinner Honors 
Fall Athletes 

by Mia F r e u n d 

The 1981 Interscholastic Ath-
letics Awards evening for fall 
sports was held on Tuesday. 
December 8 Team members, 
managers, friends and parents 
were packed into Schreiber's 
cafeteria lo hear the coaches app-
raisals of individual and group ef-
forts. Every team, of the nine fall 
sports, whether they had a winn-
ing season or not. seemed proud 
of its accomplishments. Bui as 
Mr Romeo, director of athletics, 
stated in his opening remarics. 
"rewards are nol always winn-

ing . " becaiue each leam seed to 
have formed a bond with team 
members and their coach that 
was really meaningful. In fact, it 
made them al l feel like winners 

The first team presented was 
the girls cross country team. 
They had a very successful sea-
son against difficult competition. 
The Coach's award, that award 
going lo a deserving member of a 
team who has shown some quali-
ty that ments additional recog-
nition, was presented to junior 

Ptioto by Or ly Nudal 

Janny Honan raealvai an award at tne A w a r d i Dinner from Coacn aallasheF, 
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Lisa Bradley She "held the team 
together." as Coach MacDonald 
put it. He also awarded sopho-
more Nina Samuelson as Ihe 
team's most valuable player. 

Schreiber's gir ls vol leybal l 
team made it lo the playoffs this 
fall and several of the members 
made it to the al l conference al l-
star team Among these players 
were junior Denise Zalin and 
senior Beth Kelly These girls 
were presented the Coach's 
Award and Ihe MVP award, 
respectively, by their coach. 
Carol Hulse. 

This year's fall field hockey 
team made it to Ihe Nassau Coun-
ty playoffs. Not only are al l of the 
girls extremely talented, but Ihey 
seem especially caring towards 
each other. Coach Gallagher pre-
sented four of the members wi lh 
miniature hockey slicks that 
represented spir it , sportsman-
ship and leadership, as well as 
tremendous ability The winners 
of Ihese were seniors Wendy 
Schiller. Jenny Honen. Hotly 
Levine. and junior Jennifer 
Becker Becker was an al l county 
selection player and Honen. 
L e v i n e . and sen io r L y n n 
McGregor were al l conference 
representatives McGregor was 
presented the Ellen Herman 
Most Valuable Player award. 
The Coach's Award went lo 
Honen and Levine. 

The boys football season ended 
with Ihe team third in its division 
The Bank of North America pre-
sented six of Ihe team members 
with plaques Winners of these 
were seniors Jeff Dumpson. Ron 

(Continued on page 7} 
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